
 
 
 

LOCAL GOVERNMENT ACT 1995 
 
 
 

CITY OF WANNEROO 
 
 
 

SIGNS AMENDMENT LOCAL LAW 2008 
 
 
 

Under the powers conferred by the Local Government Act 1995 and under all other powers enabling 
it, the Council of the City of Wanneroo resolved on 10 February 2009 to make the “City of Wanneroo 
Signs Amendment Local Law 2008”. 

1. Citation 
This local law may be cited as the City of Wanneroo Signs Amendment Local Law 2008. 

2. Commencement 
This local law comes into operation 14 days after the date of its publication in the Government 
Gazette. 

3. Principal Local Law 
In this local law, the City of Wanneroo Signs Local Law 1999 as published in the Government Gazette 
on 27 August 1999 is referred to as the principal local law. The principal local law is amended as 
follows. 

4. Clause 15 amended 
 (a) In subclause 1(b) delete “1.2 m2” and insert— 

“2 m2”; 
 (b) In subclause 1(f) after “on therein” insert— 

“provided that the total area of the advertisement does not exceed 50% of the glazed area of 
any one window or 10 m2 in aggregate per tenancy”; and 

 (c) In subclause 1(l) after “it is erected” insert— 
“provided the sign does not exceed 3 m in height or 3 m2 in area”. 

5. Clause 16 amended 
In subclause (j) after “glass;” delete “or”. 

6. Clause 25 amended 
In subclause (2)(b) delete “5 kms” and insert— 

“5 km”. 

7. Clause 36 deleted 
Clause 36 and its heading “Limit on Liability” are deleted. 

8. Renumbering of clauses 
Clause numbers “37” through to “44” are redesignated as “36” to “43” consecutively. 

9. First Schedule amended 
 (a) In Item no 30 in the nature of offence column delete “5kms” and insert— 
  “5 km”. 
 (b) In Item no 43 delete reference to clause number “39(2)” and insert— 
  “38(2)”. 

———— 
 
Dated: 4 March 2009. 
 
The Common Seal of the City of Wanneroo was affixed by authority of a resolution of the Council in 
the presence of— 

JON KELLY, Mayor. 
DANIEL SIMMS, Chief Executive Officer. 

9 April 2009 GOVERNMENT GAZETTE, WA 1173 


